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Date : 11-Nov-2021 07:02 PM

 Print

Basic Details
Organisation Chain Zilla Parishad||Zilla Parishad||South 24-Parganas
Tender Reference
Number WB/SPG/MMC-002/1/2021

Tender ID 2021_ZPHD_350301_1
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Wise
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical
Evaluation Allowed No ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed Yes

Payment Mode Offline Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

 

Payment Instruments
Offline S.No Instrument Type

1 RTGS/NEFT

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Cover No Cover Document Type Description

1 Fee/PreQual
/Technical .pdf NIT

2 Finance .xls BOQ
 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]
Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil
Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details
EMD Amount in ₹ 19,200 EMD through

BG/ST or EMD
Exemption
Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Additional

District
Magistrate,South
24 Parganas

EMD Payable At Kolkata

 
Click to view modification history

 
Work /Item(s)
Title WB/SPG/MMC-002/1/2021
Work Description SUPPLY OF GALVANIZED TRUNKS FOR THE KMC AND MUNICIPAL ELECTIONS
Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 9,60,000 Product Category Supply Sub category NA 
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 7 
Location Alipore, Kolkata Pincode 700027 Pre Bid Meeting Place 16/11/2021 
Pre Bid Meeting
Address

Office of the District Magistrate,
South 24 Parganas, Alipore,
Kolkata - 700027 

Pre Bid Meeting Date 16-Nov-2021
02:00 PM 

Bid Opening Place S 24 PGS
ZP

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Ten...

1 of 2 11-11-2021 07:02 PM



Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No

 
Critical Dates
Publish Date 12-Nov-2021 02:00 PM Bid Opening Date 20-Nov-2021 06:00 PM
Document Download / Sale Start
Date

12-Nov-2021 02:00 PM Document Download / Sale End
Date

18-Nov-2021 05:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 
Bid Submission Start Date 12-Nov-2021 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 18-Nov-2021 05:00 PM
 
 
Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description Document Size

(in KB)
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 472.09
 

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size

(in KB)
1 BOQ BOQ_674531.xls BOQ 276.00
 

 
 
Bid Openers List
S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1. amitghatak1@gmail.com AMIT GHATAK AMIT GHATAK
2. rdas3408@gmail.com Raju Das RAJU DAS
3. anirban_wbcs@gmail.com Anirban Bose ANIRBAN BOSE
4. aeozp-ali@gmail.com MD Samiul Alam MD SAMIUL ALAM
 
Tender Properties
Auto Tendering Process
allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details Yes

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 3

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

 

Tender Inviting Authority
Name ADM (ZP)
Address Office of the District Magistrate, South 24 Parganas, Alipore, Kolkata - 700027
 
Tender Creator Details
Created By Anirban Bose
Designation DS
Created Date 11-Nov-2021 06:53 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
Tender Details

Date : 12-Nov-2021 06:00 PM

 Print

Basic Details
Organisation Chain Zilla Parishad||Zilla Parishad||South 24-Parganas
Tender Reference
Number WB/SPG/MMC-001/1/2021

Tender ID 2021_ZPHD_350519_1
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical
Evaluation Allowed No ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed No

Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

 

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name
1 ICICI BANK
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Cover No Cover Document Type Description

1 Fee/PreQual
/Technical .pdf NIT

2 Finance .xls BOQ
 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]
Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil
Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details
EMD Amount in ₹ 96,600 EMD through BG/ST

or EMD Exemption
Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

 
Click to view modification history

 
Work /Item(s)
Title WB/SPG/MMC-001/1/2021
Work Description SUPPLY OF STATIONARY ITEMS FOR THE MUNICIPAL ELECTIONS
Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 48,26,924 Product Category CIVIL
WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 180 Period Of Work(Days) 7 
Location Alipore, Kolkata Pincode 700027 Pre Bid Meeting Place 16/11/2021 
Pre Bid Meeting
Address

Office of the District Magistrate,
South 24 Parganas, Alipore,
Kolkata - 27 

Pre Bid Meeting Date 16-Nov-2021
02:00 PM 

Bid Opening Place S 24 PGS
ZP

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No
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Critical Dates
Publish Date 12-Nov-2021 06:00 PM Bid Opening Date 20-Nov-2021 06:00 PM
Document Download / Sale Start
Date

12-Nov-2021 06:00 PM Document Download / Sale End
Date

18-Nov-2021 05:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 
Bid Submission Start Date 12-Nov-2021 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 18-Nov-2021 05:00 PM
 
 
Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description Document Size

(in KB)
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 328.22
 

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size

(in KB)
1 BOQ BOQ_675092.xls BOQ 284.50
 

 
 
Bid Openers List
S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1. amitghatak1@gmail.com AMIT GHATAK AMIT GHATAK
2. rdas3408@gmail.com Raju Das RAJU DAS
3. anirban_wbcs@gmail.com Anirban Bose ANIRBAN BOSE
4. aeozp-ali@gmail.com MD Samiul Alam MD SAMIUL ALAM
 
Tender Properties
Auto Tendering Process
allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details Yes

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

 

Tender Inviting Authority
Name ADM (ZP)
Address Office of the District Magistrate, South 24 Parganas, Alipore, Kolkata - 27
 
Tender Creator Details
Created By Anirban Bose
Designation DS
Created Date 12-Nov-2021 05:36 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
Tender Details

Date : 11-Nov-2021 10:33 PM

 Print

Basic Details
Organisation Chain Zilla Parishad||Zilla Parishad||South 24-Parganas
Tender Reference
Number WB/SPG/MMC-003/1/2021

Tender ID 2021_ZPHD_350308_1
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Wise
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical
Evaluation Allowed No ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed Yes

Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

 

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name
1 ICICI BANK
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Cover No Cover Document Type Description

1 Fee/PreQual
/Technical .pdf NIT

2 Finance .xls BOQ
 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]
Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil
Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details
EMD Amount in ₹ 19,832 EMD through BG/ST

or EMD Exemption
Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

 
Click to view modification history

 
Work /Item(s)
Title WB/SPG/MMC-003/1/2021
Work Description Supply of Voting Compartment for the KMC and Municipal Elections
Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 9,91,600 Product Category CIVIL
WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 7 
Location Alipore, Kolkata Pincode 700027 Pre Bid Meeting Place 16/11/2021 
Pre Bid Meeting
Address

Office of the District Magistrate,
South 24 Parganas, Alipore,
Kolkata - 27 

Pre Bid Meeting Date 16-Nov-2021
02:00 PM 

Bid Opening Place S 24 PGS
ZP

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No
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Critical Dates
Publish Date 12-Nov-2021 02:00 PM Bid Opening Date 20-Nov-2021 06:00 PM
Document Download / Sale Start
Date

12-Nov-2021 02:00 PM Document Download / Sale End
Date

18-Nov-2021 05:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 
Bid Submission Start Date 12-Nov-2021 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 18-Nov-2021 05:00 PM
 
 
Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description Document Size

(in KB)
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 673.78
 

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size

(in KB)
1 BOQ BOQ_674552.xls BOQ 300.50
 

 
 
Bid Openers List
S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1. amitghatak1@gmail.com AMIT GHATAK AMIT GHATAK
2. rdas3408@gmail.com Raju Das RAJU DAS
3. anirban_wbcs@gmail.com Anirban Bose ANIRBAN BOSE
4. aeozp-ali@gmail.com MD Samiul Alam MD SAMIUL ALAM
 
Tender Properties
Auto Tendering Process
allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details Yes

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 3

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

 

Tender Inviting Authority
Name ADM (ZP)
Address Office of the District Magistrate, South 24 Parganas, Alipore, Kolkata - 27
 
Tender Creator Details
Created By Anirban Bose
Designation DS
Created Date 11-Nov-2021 10:25 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
Tender Details

Date : 12-Nov-2021 06:26 PM

 Print

Basic Details
Organisation Chain Zilla Parishad||Zilla Parishad||South 24-Parganas
Tender Reference
Number WB/SPG/MMC-004/1/2021

Tender ID 2021_ZPHD_350536_1
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical
Evaluation Allowed No ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed No

Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

 

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name
1 ICICI BANK
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Cover No Cover Document Type Description

1 Fee/PreQual
/Technical .pdf NIT

2 Finance .xls BOQ
 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]
Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil
Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details
EMD Amount in ₹ 32,715 EMD through BG/ST

or EMD Exemption
Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

 
Click to view modification history

 
Work /Item(s)
Title WB/SPG/MMC-004/1/2021
Work Description SUPPLY OF DIFFERENT TYPES OF LABELS, ID CARDS AND ADHESIVE STICKERS FOR THE MUNICIPAL

ELECTIONS
Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 16,35,653 Product Category CIVIL
WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 180 Period Of Work(Days) 7 
Location Alipore, Kolkata Pincode 700027 Pre Bid Meeting Place 16/11/2021 
Pre Bid Meeting
Address

Office of the District Magistrate,
South 24 Parganas, Alipore,
Kolkata - 700027 

Pre Bid Meeting Date 16-Nov-2021
02:00 PM 

Bid Opening Place S 24 PGS
ZP

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No
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Critical Dates
Publish Date 12-Nov-2021 06:30 PM Bid Opening Date 20-Nov-2021 06:00 PM
Document Download / Sale Start
Date

12-Nov-2021 06:30 PM Document Download / Sale End
Date

18-Nov-2021 05:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 
Bid Submission Start Date 12-Nov-2021 06:30 PM Bid Submission End Date 18-Nov-2021 05:00 PM
 
 
Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description Document Size

(in KB)
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 275.24
 

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size

(in KB)
1 BOQ BOQ_675133.xls BOQ 282.50
 

 
 
Bid Openers List
S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1. amitghatak1@gmail.com AMIT GHATAK AMIT GHATAK
2. rdas3408@gmail.com Raju Das RAJU DAS
3. anirban_wbcs@gmail.com Anirban Bose ANIRBAN BOSE
4. aeozp-ali@gmail.com MD Samiul Alam MD SAMIUL ALAM
 
Tender Properties
Auto Tendering Process
allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details Yes

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

 

Tender Inviting Authority
Name ADM (ZP)
Address Office of the District Magistrate, South 24 Parganas, Alipore, Kolkata - 700027
 
Tender Creator Details
Created By Anirban Bose
Designation DS
Created Date 12-Nov-2021 06:20 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
Tender Details

Date : 12-Nov-2021 01:05 PM

 Print

Basic Details
Organisation Chain Zilla Parishad||Zilla Parishad||South 24-Parganas
Tender Reference
Number WB/SPG/MMC-005/1/2021

Tender ID 2021_ZPHD_350343_1
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical
Evaluation Allowed No ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed No

Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

 

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name
1 ICICI BANK
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Cover No Cover Document Type Description

1 Fee/PreQual
/Technical .pdf NIT

2 Finance .xls BOQ
 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]
Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil
Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details
EMD Amount in ₹ 39,000 EMD through BG/ST

or EMD Exemption
Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

 
Click to view modification history

 
Work /Item(s)
Title WB/SPG/MMC-005/1/2021
Work Description SUPPLY OF DIFFERENT TYPES OF FORMS AND ENVELOPE FOR THE KMC AND MUNICIPAL ELECTIONS
Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 19,03,620 Product Category CIVIL
WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 180 Period Of Work(Days) 7 
Location Alipore, Kolkata Pincode 700027 Pre Bid Meeting Place 16/11/2021 
Pre Bid Meeting
Address

Officer of the District Magistrate,
South 24 Parganas, Alipore,
Kolkata - 700027 

Pre Bid Meeting Date 16-Nov-2021
02:00 PM 

Bid Opening Place S 24 PGS
ZP

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No
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Critical Dates
Publish Date 12-Nov-2021 02:00 PM Bid Opening Date 20-Nov-2021 06:00 PM
Document Download / Sale Start
Date

12-Nov-2021 02:00 PM Document Download / Sale End
Date

18-Nov-2021 05:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 
Bid Submission Start Date 12-Nov-2021 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 18-Nov-2021 05:00 PM
 
 
Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description Document Size

(in KB)
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 683.97
 

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size

(in KB)
1 BOQ BOQ_674644.xls BOQ 287.50
 

 
 
Bid Openers List
S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1. amitghatak1@gmail.com AMIT GHATAK AMIT GHATAK
2. rdas3408@gmail.com Raju Das RAJU DAS
3. anirban_wbcs@gmail.com Anirban Bose ANIRBAN BOSE
4. aeozp-ali@gmail.com MD Samiul Alam MD SAMIUL ALAM
 
Tender Properties
Auto Tendering Process
allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details Yes

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

 

Tender Inviting Authority
Name ADM (ZP)
Address Officer of the District Magistrate, South 24 Parganas, Alipore, Kolkata - 700027
 
Tender Creator Details
Created By Anirban Bose
Designation DS
Created Date 12-Nov-2021 12:56 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
Tender Details

Date : 11-Nov-2021 11:49 PM

 Print

Basic Details
Organisation Chain Zilla Parishad||Zilla Parishad||South 24-Parganas
Tender Reference
Number WB/SPG/MMC-006/1/2021

Tender ID 2021_ZPHD_350313_1
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Wise
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical
Evaluation Allowed No ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed Yes

Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

 

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name
1 ICICI BANK
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Cover No Cover Document Type Description

1 Fee/PreQual
/Technical .pdf NIT

2 Finance .xls BOQ
 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]
Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil
Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details
EMD Amount in ₹ 15,000 EMD through BG/ST

or EMD Exemption
Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

 
Click to view modification history

 
Work /Item(s)
Title WB/SPG/MMC-006/1/2021
Work Description Supply of different types of Bags for the KMC and Municipal Elections
Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 7,50,000 Product Category CIVIL
WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 180 Period Of Work(Days) 7 
Location Alipore, Kolkata Pincode 700027 Pre Bid Meeting Place 16/11/2021 
Pre Bid Meeting
Address

Office of the District Magistrate,
South 24 Parganas, Alipore,
Kolkata - 27 

Pre Bid Meeting Date 16-Nov-2021
02:00 PM 

Bid Opening Place S 24 PGS
ZP

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No
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Critical Dates
Publish Date 12-Nov-2021 02:00 PM Bid Opening Date 20-Nov-2021 06:00 PM
Document Download / Sale Start
Date

12-Nov-2021 02:00 PM Document Download / Sale End
Date

18-Nov-2021 05:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 
Bid Submission Start Date 12-Nov-2021 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 18-Nov-2021 05:00 PM
 
 
Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description Document Size

(in KB)
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 675.07
 

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size

(in KB)
1 BOQ BOQ_674561.xls BOQ 305.50
 

 
 
Bid Openers List
S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1. amitghatak1@gmail.com AMIT GHATAK AMIT GHATAK
2. rdas3408@gmail.com Raju Das RAJU DAS
3. anirban_wbcs@gmail.com Anirban Bose ANIRBAN BOSE
4. aeozp-ali@gmail.com MD Samiul Alam MD SAMIUL ALAM
 
Tender Properties
Auto Tendering Process
allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details Yes

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 3

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

 

Tender Inviting Authority
Name ADM (ZP)
Address Office of the District Magistrate, South 24 Parganas, Alipore, Kolkata - 27
 
Tender Creator Details
Created By Anirban Bose
Designation DS
Created Date 11-Nov-2021 11:44 PM
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